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1. It is hereby ordered that the 
adherent to the democratically 
centralized Military 
Revolutionary Committee 
(henceforth MRC), a 
subcommittee of the Central 
Committee, Ariel Plotnik, 
produce an analysis of the battle 
of Khan Younis. 


2. Within or before, whichever may 
be sooner, a fortnight the 
adherent must produce an 
analysis no less than 2,000 
words in length, noting from 
beginning to end the key 
elements of the battle with an 
international scope from foreign 
sources of public information 
(FSoPI).


3. Upon review of the analysis by 
the MRC the analysis shall 
thereafter be published as the 
MRC’s official analysis of the 
battle. 
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